RNI No. MAHBIL /2009/31732

TE o, 3Tk 2¢] TEAR T FHAR, AR ¥-20, 018/ Hifdieh 23-2%, Ik 2¥3 [T 92, fohmer: T .00

UTFerehe USRI

HERTSE YITEAT Shsi o JATATTIATaE qaR shedeT (W Ueh, Weh—37 3TTTUT Ueh-oF AT
ufag oot & sewr Tieafaitem) fem a s

Taa fawmT

TG HTHT A1, EATHT T <,
HATE, GaE Yoo 03, falH ¢ A 2032,

CIBECE
S IGIDRCI G RIS
AT T -3 02 % /1.5, %4 2 /TaT- ¥, — TRATET T 31T 3 0% ST WehIGR JaT sheledll ST
TR & FERTT TITA, ATER, HERT AR ST (Frafaaare sfermeiienor) fom, 214 a1 TuRe Garon
FIUAITS JEiet e il eTmed:—

9. A femie, HerTse ARt e (frgfaadare STeRTeiieor) (urem) =, 2032 31 =T,

R, TR AN e (Fgferarer SioRmeieor) W, ¢ (AT Age e 89 “ge fam” o1 shett
3T e fm 3 = dre-fem () well, —

(%) G (T) HES “IRAT 2057 9 AeTeramiiers” a1 AT “fohal HTeieh, o1 J hianm” &
TSTehY. STIeT SREe! hUATd Jsl STl e HIHTS e STeT SRIe ShIuaTd ST ST AU J5a;

(@) @ (I) e, —
(Th) SU-TE (TH) AU TE;
(SF) ST-WE (T) TS “9 STHNMR” BT TSI TesUaTd Fct.

(2)




R TERTSE I TS0, 9T IR -3, TEAR o FEraR, FIega ¥-20, 2038 /it 23-2 %, ek 2%%3
3. e frawien fam o 7, —

(%) Wre-fr (2) Welet “Teh-arisT” a1 TSIt ‘ool aaeh” BT Holehs GRael sheuad Aset 3for
A1 TR 9 AT R0 0) TR SR FIUATT ST ST AT A5,

(@) Tre-frr () s Gretier A7 FH1fere FHuard 38 —
0. — Jenfy, 2 gFher U TeuT=l 3THe.

(1) Ure -Fam (R ) Wl “Teh-garaier” A1 HeTpIuest ‘o6 <ok BT HoTehs QRael shiudTd dsel ST
1 feTeR R ThgaRt R0 0 I TRATT VAT ST ST HIUITT A5,

¥, oA i fem ¢ AR qeie fam, SieT Sreet Seudnd Jgat STl ferieh 30 T - ¢ TR ST Srae
FIOATT ST ST THSUATT ISt

(W) “¢31. Fgfaaa-ren SToRmefiehd =N I - FATIHT ho—
(2) (T) =1 T4 AR HHARA feieh @ TR /¢y IS fohal @, e Hafera-r=n
T STORTEGR SheTl STEET ST YT hHaTATATEId, il STORTINGR chelcdl HRT AT Hallf-aie
UeRT oY qUT SR, T S0 et
(&) ST HHAT T fAgiaaa-raT IrT SToRMNRd ohell STHCT ST I TeRT Tt shrefrat
fa.2 uftrer 2Ry qdi= qot Sreren o1e, 1o Wehvont fagfaad-rar sTormefeha o femiss ¢ ufiret ¢y U
T 0T A5,
(R) SR dre-fFam (2 ) 7o fafaaaTaT STeRmeNehd shetell WRT g4 fEaT STuam U STumy

(3) FgfaodTeRe™ feie ¢ TRt 8¢y TS fohal @M HaTi=n REUR Te’T oy qof sheft
ST ST TR T G ST, @ SRR aRe <@, faieh L Ufiiet ¢ ¢4 TR fehar fHadt=n
ARG TR T 2T TRGEAT qUf I, ATdeh! STt Fek=il A 3186 < aREuH, fafaaaemeren
Y= TRETH A eharen fesUarg gashaR ST, A1 TSI, FHEIeiR ARy SEie fHafaera
T TR MFEeRROTeR S 37T ohidl Jear.

(%) STORTMhd ShetedT ST Wifed! Fgfaad- TeMH ST Siadd T¥el 3TN aredrd tHafada-
Hfereor wfererzor, < mfedt, Sm e sifesr=m fafaaa wer 1wt et 2l o o STfeshTThg T
T e Hsel.

() Traforera Gfemwor miterton, s orar fierar fHafaads Tem e e /e o
ETTIERIT, AT S e CTaTa oA STeehd= IS aTesUil shUaTHIe! Teish fHgfaera-Te Hehtom=r Squt
queitet gt fectean fgfaerda-ren Yeiae sesdia.

(&) 1 U4 WERIT FHATAAT WS- STl SUSHATTE, T HeAives, -k See
Teh-qaieT TN STORTRION ShedHR SaRd fHgfaad-Tren Tl SRRihd Jeareadk sifad @y
R 3T / TR faehed feetall ST o TS I HHaRt fHafaadenes om0 §g
SATHos o AT RIS STo ThIUTdTe! T fHe U BaehaR STHUR FRid.”;

() 379 R T SRt shotedn oM ¢ 31 9ed, —

(Teh) Tre-fem () HeElied, e () FR, Wieiiel TIeEenio] GHIfose hiuard d9a 37T 1 fE. 3¢
AT 2% 0 IR FHIAE ohetl ST AT J5et:—




HERTE ITEH TS, R IR~ 37, THAR § FLAR, AIRa) ¥-20, 038 /e §3-2 R, Ik 2R%3 3

‘T TRTUT, — IR ST e HaT g feriehaR FHgfaeraTan 9T SfeRTeiehd shetl
ST TR e, e fHgfaaa-r=n AmT, S feAiehTen STRRiehd holell STHel ®1 MR &Rt
T 0f SR T 0T AEe. s

(3 Tre-fam (R), Iesuard et SAfOTdr . R et R 02 4 TR GGV ST ST HvaTd
RESE

(<) dre-fam (&), Tesvard Fger Saor dr .2 € 7 233\ TR TN ST ST HIUTT
RECH

. T framre fem ¢ 31 AR, IEid e el Sraet huard et ST 3.3 7 2]-\ URgH SiIey <
FIOATT ST ST AU Il

“¢q. TSR & STHHE fehar TareR HeeiHe foha Tenfen SR Ta e UMed S,
TR 1ok TohH ThRel 3T 3T IHhE hAar=re aredrd, 1: fooiean Fafaad-ren ts-gaaisT
T STORTSMR AT IR VTSI, - T I AT Grelsif-eh & SUshATTe feha Tarerd
ey foha T TXAiwed, T el WM Saeaa, THehH! 3l TFhH THIhReied Shuariel g-:
feetedn fafaad-T=an Teh-JaraieT SaeT STRTEAT YehHdIe YEROT ST Jeldes! R shetedl FHURTER
& & frremre e @ = de-fem (3) well,—

(TF) T (T), Tel FAY “T+R TG BT FTRT ST T8 A2t et “fes Fgfearen <&t
THRITE" BT TR Qe ST ASe;

(3F) W (&), T <A1 AT foahTolt “SivR S0 BT HSTRt T ST UTeh thhRITE STe 3718 & T
v, T femin faw Qo wel,—

() forermm Wehge Treiiel e THIfese v JEt AT fE, 22 AT 213 % IR FHIfae SHivard
A IR AU I

TFenH fofAfcedicn Fug sheft T8 ST A=A fHURTTaR @@= FafaadTd emon v oTel

ST ST YcTaf WA YEROT AT el A W, FHafaad-TeRen s=sT TeRid shell 318 m,

T gaia ifaw fHafiera-ren Th-garaie saer Tafeqdd e sifad fafaad-ren stermefewomen

TR YR 9 ATE U df I .

(&) ST AR STE SR cheTedl TRARME “Teh-gaarer” A1 HSehuast “<Tesid 2o 81 FeTeh Qe
THIOATT A5 ST T S, 39 TRaRT R0 0] TR SRET VAT AT STHeAT AU I

(3T) ST FehR HHITTEE Sheledl RAPHM JEidd W STel S v dsel: —

‘R AT 3T <, FENIT o ST STSUTTHR, ATEH, TS THET, S0 S&e shell
T T T TR R 5, ST ST Shieeiedl ST fe-TehTIRI WaT Hig =<l shicTTaeid, e,
IS Hard MEehT=ehe 3751 AR Il J5al. SR a8, TRl ThHTS! 3751 hild T9d
feha a1 waIter TeiehRa F8e @, o, Gad SeRIRumaTe! sege Al 31 fed ervard Aga.” .
(a1 Toermm wRaeme, -

(T ) “B” A1 ATepEst “Tig STORET o7 i 8T HThY SRaet huard Jea;




¥ HERTE ITE AU, R IR~ 37, THAR o FLAN, FIRaT ¥-20, 038 /il 23-2, Ik %3

(ST a1 <o foshToft “SieR EoR” BT HSTehR TT=AT SATehfUTeh ShRORRIEE STl 3T T < foehmoft

¢. & Tawn fam 3 welie],—
(%) tre-fam (R) 3% gH= 3Tefid “cran” 1 AR “eX” 8l Hele SRaet HIvad e,
(@) dre-frm (3) 7ed “TREd!” A1 TSRSt “ARET " 2 HTH SRael ShuaTd J5aT;
() dre-feH (3 ) Hed WehTdie-

(T) e (F) LTSl Ieia TE Rael HIUTd dgat TI0T al fEieh 3 7 2] % o TR Rael hvdrd
ST STHeAT U d5ei:-

‘(&) EE (&) #eA faffde shetedn HaTai=a W Sietel fHafera-re SR
3TT HIVIATET 3751, T ToseR T ST el AT SRUMTE UhelesudTd AUR HTal ST SR fHafaad-ren
STORTONRIUTET ST 3751, VeI HHAITAT Hal-Teie feieh fehal @qdl Sraterd TgEr ared
AT 3T R, 3T e SRR @ Jafaxien Jeer feae ffved 2ga.”.

(&) G () o FIATHI SREe HI0ATT ATl W (¥F) FMeovdrd Asel.

2. TEA frawi=n fW R0, TEE We-fam (R) =1 @ (&) HEier “e” A1 Felguast ‘T qie
STERT=ITET” BT HSTehY QREel ShiUaTd el

g@ﬁamwﬁw RR, A Uie-fEm (%) = e (W) Heliet ‘SR ¥ A1 ASipuasi “qes
AT <51 SRl BT ATt Qrael shiudTd dsel.

?%. A Famier fam 3, 7o die-faw (2) Heliel TWene <21 “TivR S0 T HeThY AT SATehiiureh
RIS T 4T {Seh1oll ST 3T, et a2 “Hos fHgfaad-Te <al 2o BT HoTehs T SATHIUIeh hhRIHE

TR HIUATA I
3. & e Sieeied FYAT - T Hed WIGTCTsHToT JEIROT HR0ATd Id 31,
(%) A-Tsh qe,
(T ) TS ¢ T,
(%) G (T) TS “/ STHMEIR” F “/ STRMERRT” & TSR SRTevaTd A
(@) e () aeuard I,

(3 ST TR “THGAIT” AT HTFRIGST “TNeA <k AR SR FHIUATd Ased STIfr ol ferieh
R THaRI R0 0% TRIT TRACT FRUATT ST ST AU JEeT;

(@) 9 19 02 aR=ae ¥ Heliet “R68 " BT TSTehR amesard el
23. A AT Seeiedn T - o T2 Wiy 1ol GERUT shvdnd ad 378, —
() FordepraTeiier shameiel AT Tesvard JEaT;
(@) 9N-Teh 7,
(Th) STIhHIh ¢ HE, -
(%) G (T) TEieT “/ STHMEIR” F “/ STRMERRT” & TSR SRTevaTd A
(@) T () v I,

?o.
frgfaa




HERTE ITEH TS, R IR~ 37, THAR § FLAR, AIRa) ¥-20, 038 /e §3-2 R, Ik 2R%3 Y

() 29 AL “ThHGAIIeT” A1 TIPS TN <k BT AR TRaet hvad Jsel STt
far. 26 ThgaRY R0 0% TR IRIE FIUAT ST ST HHUETT Jge;

(1) 9T 19 et UR=ae ¥ Wl “6 8" BT HeTahr aTaavaTd da.
R¥. T FEHMT Siected T - | e Wi eTyHIo FERoT U 4d 3718,
(%) A-Tsh qe,
(T ) STIRAI 22 HEA, -
(F) Ge (T) Felied “/ ITHMEFR” T “/ ITRNAINE" & AR SN Adhie;
(W) e () e AE;

(3 2T AL “WhHGAIIeT” A1 TIPS TN <k BT AR TRaet hvad Jsel STt
feieh 0 Thgarl R0 0% TG TR HITAT ST ST HHUA JT;

(@) 9N =R W&, 3TIshHIe ¢ e, “3& & -Fgfea o s Fanfgfd emd-st-fHafaadar siormfied
T AT ASTHAUSH, “A AN o TS TG al” BT AoTeh? SRae] ShivaTd Jeal.

4. T mre Sieeiel F9A1 — UF fEHieh 3 Set R0 24, TR SMesvand JEa.

R&. AT U AR, Eret AT ST SRA huad dse ST T ferieh & TR 2 1<y, T ST SRaet shivdrd
ST ST HHUATT 5t :—

Tt
[ fam ¢31(w) wer) |
fafaa ferRor o= W= SRR T Y- Eq-reATETed I fafed W et i
IO AT ST Y-l T,
(Frafreram Sz seum= e qusii )

2,. ..................................................
.

o ANTEFIHE U AL L DRVAUTUE % 000000000000 0000000000000000000000000000000000000

o  UEIEATFINT D 700 2D L MTERKT ZUITTUTUE 000000000000 0000000000000000000000000000000000000
¥ {kehy :

o CAMY TTETIEATEINL LD AL NTUTUITL % 4000000000000000000000000000000000000000000000000

. e A A A A A A A A A A A R RS R A AR AR A A A A AR A R A

. SANTIHETIANL TN N LD D EEIEREEIAL LD D NTUTUHITE 000000000000 0000000000000000000000000000000000000
© RSJ EI(_‘| h YU :

. SANTTIHETIAL THEN T T I ZEN TR ERATTUE 240000000000 00000000000000000000000000000000000000

. SN TTIELE AL TN THE T ERE N DT T THE 200000000000 00000000000000000000000000000000000000

. p HETEAMTQE MTERTN TN % 0000000000000000000000000000000000000000000000000

Tt IvmR 2Afeerr.



& HERTS YT TSI, 9T IR-37, TR o AR, A6 ¥-20, R0 [ahifdeh 3-8, ITh 23%3
qﬁ)
TRTIEIS (T § STIAId-¢ ), HeRTe, e,
TRITEIIE (TE d STIHIdl-R ), HeRme, AR, ",

U, A FawT= foer qeraret “ardT-Tah” STHT -Ta shich SUATd Jsel STIUT qeral-Ueh =R Jeiet qer
STTeT SRaE AT 5T —

“FeraT-gI
[ ¢ (2);R8 (9); 3¢ (&) 3MMTRR (2) a1 (R) T ]
(f&.R ThgamRt R0 0% TR @F])
st T T9T fHafaaa-TeRRar oo g
TA-Tos Fgfaera x ¥o ah X ¢ X T HHEAATAT Yob TSI feRIaR STERIT Jeial STfeT grom=
AR SRR Y.

e T TG G T e T TG G W R oY S S W

IR IR IR
R0 2.2% %2 Q.00 &% ¢.0%3
2 R.2L0 0 R.04% &3 ©.3¢R
R R.2¢8 %3 3.0%0 &% ©.L8R
32 R.2¢4 %% R.02% &Y 0,032
R% 2.20% Yy AL &% .42
Y R.2¢3 % A {E ©.¥32
3% R.2¢3 %0 £R%3 3 0.8
3 2.2¢0 % AT &% 0,003
L4 R.QW¢ ¥R C.LLR Yo §.LR9
R R.R\e% Yo L.L¥8 e §.903
30 R.203 42 ¢.Lol E &.40R
3 ].26% 4R ¢80l ©3 §.3%8
3R R.28% 43 £.\9%% 0¥ §.0lY4
32 R.24% 4y ¢89e oy 4.L0R
3% R.24R 4y ¢&R o8, 404
2 2.2%4 4& AN oo 4. %43
25 REH 4o ARE! o 4.33%
39 R.2R% w<e £.6%% v 4.02¢
3¢ 2.228 43 L3} ¢o %.09R
R ].203 §o LR A1 %522
%o R.0%0 &2 L%
HERTSGT AT <A STSUTHR F A1,
fadt s



HERTE ITEH TS, R IR~ 37, THAR § FLAR, AIRa) ¥-20, 038 /e §3-2 R, Ik 2R%3 9
FINANCE DEPARTMENT

Madam Cama Marg, Hutatma Rajguru Chowk,
Mantralaya, Mumbai 400 032, dated the 1st November 2021.

NOTIFICATION
CONSTITUTION OF INDIA.

No. MSC-2019/C.R.451/SER-4.—In exercise of the powers conferred by the proviso to article 309 of
the Constitution of India, the Governor of Maharashtra is hereby pleased to make the following rules
further to amend the Maharashtra Civil Services (Commutation of Pension) Rules, 1984, namely :—

1. These rules may be called the Maharashtra Civil Services (Commutation of Pension)
(Amendment) Rules, 2021.

2. Inrule 3 of the Maharashtra Civil Services (Commutation of Pension) Rules, 1984 (hereinafter
referred to as “the principal Rules”), in sub-rule (1),—

(a) in clause (a), after the words “Auditor General of India” the words “or Director, Accounts
and Treasury” shall be added and shall always be deemed to have been added,;

(b) in clause (d), -
(i) sub-clause (2) shall be deleted;
(1) in sub-clause (i7), the words “including sub-treasury,” shall be deleted.
3. Inrule 5 of the principal Rules,—

(a) in sub—rule (1), for the words “one-third” the words “forty per cent.” shall be substituted
and shall be deemed to have been substituted with effect from the 27th February 2009 ;

(b) Following Note be inserted after sub-rule (1).—
Note — However, this entitlement would be optional.

(¢) in sub-rule (2), for the words “one-third” the words “forty per cent.” shall be substituted
and shall be deemed to have been substituted with effect from the 27th February 2009.

4. After rule 8 of the principal Rules, the following rule shall be added and shall be deemed to
have been added with effect from the 30th May 1988, namely:—

(A) “8A. Restoration of commuted portion of Pension.—

(1) (a) In cases, where Government Servant who has commuted a portion of his pension
on the 1st April 1985 or thereafter, his pension shall be restored after completion of fifteen
years of his retirement.

(b) In cases, where a Government Servant commuted a portion of his pension and
completed fifteen years before the 1st April 1985, his pension shall be restored with effect
from the 1st April 1985.

(2) Each pensioner, who is eligible to get the commuted portion of his pension restored
under sub-rule (1) above shall apply in the Form-F duly completed, to the Pension Disbursing
Authority.

(3) In cases, where the pensioner has completed fifteen years from the date of retirement
on the 1st April 1985 or thereafter and had died subsequently, his legal heirs are also
entitled to receive arrears with effect from the 1st April 1985 or from date of completion of
fifteen years from the date of retirement whichever is later, till the date of the pensioner’s
death. For this purpose, legal heirs may also apply to the Pension Disbursing Authority.

(4) In the cases, where the pension payment order does not contain information
regarding commuted portion, the Pension Disbursing Authority shall obtain the information
from the Accounts Officer who had issued the pension payment order.



¢ HERTE ITE AU, R IR~ 37, THAR o FLAN, FIRaT ¥-20, 038 /il 23-2, Ik %3

(5) The Pension Disbursing Authority shall intimate to the Accounts Officer, who had
issued the pension payment order, the full particulars of each pension case alongwith the
amount of pension restored for verifying its correctness in the Form G.

(6) The State Government employees, who had absorbed under Public Sector
Undertaking, Autonomous Bodies, Local Bodies, etc. and have received or opted to receive
commuted value for one third of pension as well as terminal benefits equal to the commuted
value of the balance amount of pension after commuting one third of pension, are not
entitled to any benefit under these provisions as they have ceased to be State Government
Pensioners.”;

(B) In rule 8A as so added,—

(1) in sub-rule (1), after the clause (b), the following Explanation shall be inserted and
shall be deemed to have been inserted with effect from the 28th March 1990, namely:—

“Explanation.—In cases, where a Government Servant commuted the portion of
pension after the date of retirement, his pension shall be restored after completion of
fifteen years from the date of commutation of pension.”;

(i1) sub-rule (2) shall be deleted and shall be deemed to have been deleted with effect
from 2nd July 2015;

(ii1) sub-rule (6) shall be deleted and shall be deemed to have been deleted with effect
from 26th May 1997.

5. After rule 8A of the principal Rules, the following rule shall be added and shall be deemed
to have been added with effect from 26th May 1997, namely.—

“8B. Revision of the restored amount of one-third commuted portion of pension in respect
of the State Government employees who had drawn lumpsum amount on their absorption in a
Public Sector Undertaking or Autonomous Body or Local Body.— The cases of the revision of the
restored amount of one-third commuted portion of pension of absorbed Government employees,
who had drawn lumpsum amount on absorption, in a Public Sector Undertaking or Autonomous
Body or Local Body shall be regulated as per the Government Resolution issued by Government
in this regard, from time to time.”.

6. Inrule9 of the principal Rules, in sub-rule (3),—

() in clause (a), for the words “one hundred rupees” wherever it occurs, the words “ten per
cent. of basic pension” shall be substituted;

(i1) in clause (b), for the words “one hundred rupees” or “rupees one hundred” wherever it
occurs, the words “ten per cent. of basic pension” shall be substituted.

7. In Rule 10 of the principal Rules,—

(a) before the existing proviso, the following proviso shall be inserted and shall be deemed
to have been inserted with effect from 11th March 1994, namely:—

“Provided that, if a pensioner has specifically mentioned the amount of commutation of
his final pension in his application of commutation of pension and as a result of Government
decision his final pension has been revised and enhanced retrospectively, if the pensioner
expresses his willingness, he is entitled to revised and enhanced amount of commutation
of his final pension upto one-third of revised final pension:”;

(b) in the proviso as so added, for the words “one-third” the words “forty per cent.” shall be
substituted and shall be deemed to have been substituted with effect from the 27th February
20009;

(c) after the proviso as so inserted the following proviso shall be added, namely :—

Provided further that, as per revised Pay Commission Order, the Government has
changed the pay scale and pension has been revised and enhanced retrospectively, the



HERTE ITEH TS, R IR~ 37, THAR § FLAR, AIRa) ¥-20, 038 /e §3-2 R, Ik 2R%3 ]

pensioner may opt for difference of commutation, and he may submit the application to the
concerned authority for the same within six months from the date of order issued by the
Government. If the pensioner does not apply or opt for the difference it is presumed that
he is not interested for revised commutation.

(d) in the existing proviso,—
(@) for the words “Provided that” the words “Provided also that” shall be substituted;

(i1) for the words “rupees one hundred” or “one hundred rupees” wherever it occurs,
the words “ten per cent. of basic pension” shall be substituted.

8. Inrule 13 of the principal Rules, in sub-rule (3),—

(i) for the words “pension papers prior to” the words “pension papers up to” shall be
substituted ;

(i1) in the proviso,—

(a) for clause (c¢) the following shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have been
substituted with effect from 3rd March 1990, namely:—

“(c) no such application of commutation of pension received after period specified in
clause (b) shall be rejected on the ground of not received it in time and if such application of
commutation of pension is received by the Head of office on or before the date of retirement
of Government servant, the commutation of pension shall become absolute on the next day
of his retirement.”.

(b) clause (b) and clause (¢) as so substituted shall be deleted.

9. In rule 20 of the principal Rules, in sub-rule (1), in clause (b), after the word “the request”
the words “to the Audit Officer” shall be substituted.

10. In rule 22 of the principal Rules, sub-rule (1), in clause (b), for the words “one hundred
rupees” the words “ten per cent. of basic pension” shall be substituted.

11. In rule 25 of the principal Rules, in sub-rule (1), in clause (b), for the word “subject” the
word “send” shall be substituted.

12. Inrule 31 of the principal Rules, in sub-rule (1), in the proviso, for the words “one hundred
rupees” wherever it occurs, the words “ten per cent. of basic pension” shall be substituted.

13. In Form A appended to the principal Rules,—
(a) in Part-I,
() in serial No.11,—
(@) in clause (a) the words “/ Sub-Treasury” shall be deleted,;
(b) clause (b) shall be deleted,;

(i1) in the Note, for the words “one-third” the words “forty per cent.” shall be substituted
and shall be deemed to have been substituted with effect from the 27th February 2009;

(b) In part III, in para 4, the figures “266” shall be deleted.
14. In Form B appended to the principal Rules,
(a) In the bracket mentioned below the title, the sentence is deleted.
(b) in Part-I,
(1) in serial no.8,—
(a) in clause (a) the words “/ Sub-treasury” shall be deleted,;
(b) clause (b) shall be deleted,;



20

15.

HERTE ITE AU, R IR~ 37, THAR o FLAN, FIRaT ¥-20, 038 /il 23-2, Ik %3

(i1) in the Note, for the words “one-third” the words “forty per cent.” shall be substituted
and shall be deemed to have been substituted with effect from the 27th February 2009;

(¢) In part III, in para 4, the figures “266” shall be deleted.
In Form C appended to the principal Rules,—
(a) in Part-I,
() in serial No.11,—
(@) in clause (a), the words “/ Sub-treasury” at both the places, shall be deleted;
(b) clause (b), shall be deleted ;

(i1) in the Note, for the words “one-third” the words “forty per cent.” shall be substituted
and shall be deemed to have been substituted with effect from the 27th February 2009.

(b) In part IV, at serial No. 8, for the figures and words “266-Pension and Other Retirement

Benefits-B-Commuted Value of Pensions” the words “Mention Proper Budget Head Here” shall
be substituted.

16.
17.
18.

In Form E, in Part I, after the words “here enter the” the words “name of” shall be inserted.
Form F appended to the principal Rules shall be deleted with effect from 2nd July 2015.
After Form F, the following form shall be added and shall be deemed to have been added

with effect from the 1st April 1985, namely :—

“FORM—G
(See Rule 8A(5))

Form of Intimation by the Pension Disbursing Authority to the Pension Payment Order Issuing
Authority regarding restoration of Commuted Portion of Pension.

S A A o i e

To,

19.

(Particulars of Pension Disbursing Authority)

Name of Pensioner PP PPPPPORROPPPPRRNE
Date of Retirement PP PPPPPORROPPPPRRNE
Pension Payment Order No. L e ttteetteett——————————————————————————————————————————..
Amount of Original Pension L e ttteetteett——————————————————————————————————————————..
Amount of Pension Commuted et st ae e et ae e e e
Amount of Pension restored PP PPPPPORROPPPPRRNE
Effective Date of restoration et e e e et te e e e eees it aee s
Amount of Pension after restoration :........ccccccviiiiiiiiiniiiiiie

Additional remarks, if any L e ettttertettu.——————————————————————————————————————_—.

(Signature of Office-in-charge)
Pay and Accounts Officer, Mumbai /
Treasury Officer.

The Accountant General (A & E)-I, Maharashtra, Mumbai.
The Accountant General (A & E)-II, Maharashtra, Nagpur.”.
The existing table to the principal Rules shall be renamed as “TABLE-I” and after TABLE-I

as so renamed, the following Table shall be added, namely:—



FERTE, JTEH STU, 9T IR-37, THAR 3 Fear, HIeEe ¥-20, 03¢ /lideh $3-2%, Ik 2R¥3

“TABLE-II

[See rules 8 (1); 26 (7); 28 (5) and 29 (1) & (2)]
(applicable from the 27th February 2009)

Basic Formula: Basic Pension x 40% x 12 x commutation value at age next birthday

Commutation value for a pension of rupee 1 per annum

based on the date of original application of Government servant.

%R

Age next Commutation Age next Commutation  Age next Commutation Value
birthday Value expressed birthday Value expressed birthday expressed as number
as number of as number of of year’s purchase
year’s purchase year’s purchase

20 9.19 41 9.075 62 8.093
21 9.187 42 9.059 63 7.982
22 9.186 43 9.040 64 7.862
23 9.185 44 9.019 65 7.731
24 9.184 45 8.996 66 7.591
25 9.183 46 8.971 67 7.431
26 9.182 47 8.943 68 7.262
27 9.180 48 8.913 69 7.083
28 9.178 49 8.881 70 6.897
29 9.176 50 8.846 71 6.703
30 9.173 51 8.808 72 6.502
31 9.169 52 8.708 73 6.296
32 9.164 53 8.724 74 6.085
33 9.159 54 8.678 75 5.872
34 9.152 55 8.627 76 5.057
35 9.145 56 8.572 77 5.443
36 9.136 57 8.512 78 5.229
37 9.126 58 8.446 79 5.018
38 9.116 59 8.371 80 4.812
39 9.103 60 8.287 81 4.611
40 9.090 61 8.194 ”

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

Additional Chief Secretary to Government.

NITIN GADRE,

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY DIRECTOR,
RUPENDRA DINESH MORE, PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD,
MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATIONS,
21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004. EDITOR : DIRECTOR, RUPENDRA DINESH MORE.



